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Good Morning Mr. Thoo:
 
Eckerd Connects appreciates the opportunity to provide public comment regarding the selec2on process and
recommenda2on for the Career Services RFP.
 

1. The Agenda highlights the connec2on ResCare has in other communi2es with the local libraries.  Eckerd
Connects, as iden2fied in our proposal, is already working with the local libraries in the San Jose area.  Prior to
the pandemic, we were providing in-person workshops and currently have been providing online workshops
with input from the librarians.  We are already in this community – providing this service. 

2. The Agenda highlights ResCare’s ability to offer extended hours.  Eckerd Connects also iden2fied in our
proposal that staff are able to conduct services, par2cularly via online pla_orms, during extended hours.

3. The Agenda Item indicates Eckerd Connects did not submit contract performance data for the San Jose area. 
It should be noted that performance data for our current contract was provided in response to Ques2on 5,
which reads in part, Please describe your organiza2on’s experience serving diverse customers and Indicate
performance requirements and related performance data to substan2ate your success with these or similar
popula2ons.  As we do not have the scores for each sec2on, we are not sure how this affects the overall
scoring for this sec2on.

4. Eckerd Connects would advocate for maintaining a single provider in South County.  Given that Eckerd
Connects scored higher  (82.5) than IRC (79) in the youth evalua2on, we respec_ully request reconsidera2on
of the recommenda2on made to award IRC the youth services in the South County area.  This is a small
community and the addi2on of another provider opera2ng under work2future causes confusion for employers
and the community in general.  Both agencies, Eckerd and IRC, would be contac2ng the same employer and
partner communi2es for assistance with serving our clients crea2ng a duplica2on of effort and services. 

5. We believe that a transi2on to different providers during this 2me of a Pandemic will be a disservice to the
staff, clients and partner and employer community. Clients have already demonstrated an increased need to
connect with their career advisors, employers and training providers.   We request reconsidera2on for a
change in service providers, par2cularly during this difficult 2me.
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Eckerd Connects is an established, incumbent provider delivering impac_ul services in the San Jose/Santa
Clara County Region with a trained, professional staff team in place.  We request that these important factors
are considered during your review and decision-making process.
Thank you for your considera2on.
 
 
Tammy Aguilera
Senior	Opera+ons	Director

 

ECKERD CONNECTS | Workforce Development

P: (805) 305-5425
E: taguilera@eckerd.org

 
STAY CONNECTED
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